



JEFFERSON COUNTY, GEORGIA
OGEECHEE CROSSING PARK IMPROVMENTS
BIDS RECEIVED: TUESDAY, MARCH 1, 2022*

CONTRACTOR	Total Amount Bid Division 1	A-1	A-2	A-3	A-4	A-5	A-6	Total Amount Bid Division 2	Total Amount Bid Division 3	Total Amount Bid Division 4	A-1	A-2
Lavender & Associates, Inc. Statesboro, Georgia	\$ 2,338,783.00	(\$13,000.00)	(\$8,000.00)	(\$13,000.00)	\$ -	(\$500.00)	(\$500.00)	\$ 158,440.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -
DeRalco, Inc. Augusta, Georgia	\$ 2,131,498.00	(\$1,146.00)	(\$1,800.00)	(\$470.00)	(\$4,075.00)	(\$100.00)	(\$100.00)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -
Beam Site Prep, LLC North Augusta, South Carolina	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 106,467.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -
Sandersville Well and Septic Co., LLC Sandersville, Georgia	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 171,935.20	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -

**As-read amounts in no particular order*

Augusta, Georgia
 Project No. 202338